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Welcome to Seaside Prep, a prestigious boarding school where the pursuit
of excellence extends beyond the classroom and onto the ice rink. But
beneath the veneer of academic achievement and athletic prowess lies a
dark secret.

When star hockey player Brad "Bulldog" Evans is found brutally murdered,
the school is thrown into chaos. As the investigation unfolds, suspicion falls
on a host of suspects, including teammates, rivals, and even the school's
enigmatic faculty.

Enter Detective Emily Carter, a seasoned investigator who arrives at
Seaside Prep determined to uncover the truth behind Bulldog's untimely
demise. With her sharp wit and unwavering determination, Emily
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meticulously dissects the clues, delving into the hidden lives and
motivations of those connected to the victim.

A Suspect Pool as Vast as the Ocean

As Emily's investigation deepens, she encounters a diverse cast of
characters, each with their own secrets and agendas. There's Bulldog's
bitter rival, Jake "The Enforcer" Walsh, who harbors a deep-seated grudge
against the slain player.

There's also the mysterious and alluring headmaster's daughter, Anya
Petrova, who seems to have been intimately involved with Bulldog. And
let's not forget the enigmatic hockey coach, Mike "Iron Mike" Kovacs,
whose stoic demeanor hides a troubled past.

The Truth Hidden Under Layers of Ice

As Emily digs deeper, she uncovers a web of deceit, betrayal, and long-
buried secrets. The residents of Seaside Prep have something to hide, and
they'll stop at nothing to keep their secrets safe.

But Emily is not one to back down from a challenge. With the help of a few
trusted allies, she peels back the layers of deception, exposing the
shocking truth that lies beneath the pristine façade of Seaside Prep.

A Gripping Read that Keeps You Guessing

"Drawing Blood: The Seaside Prep Hockey Mystery" is a captivating tale
that will keep you guessing until the very end. Author William Sharp weaves
a complex and suspenseful plot, painting a vivid picture of a school torn
apart by tragedy.



Sharp's characters are richly developed, each with their own unique
motivations and complexities. The investigation is both thrilling and
thought-provoking, as it delves into the dark underbelly of privilege and
ambition.

Don't Miss Out on the Mystery That Will Leave You Trembling

If you're looking for a thrilling and suspenseful mystery that will keep you on
the edge of your seat, then "Drawing Blood: The Seaside Prep Hockey
Mystery" is the perfect book for you.

Prepare to be drawn into a world of intrigue, deception, and murder. As
Emily Carter unravels the truth, you'll find yourself questioning everything
you thought you knew about Seaside Prep and its inhabitants.

Free Download your copy today and experience the gripping mystery that
will haunt you long after you finish the final page.
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